
 

 

 

 

Rincón del Socorro 
Day 1.   
Europe – Buenos Aires: 

Departure in an international night flight. Night on board. 

 

Day 2.   
Buenos Aires - Iguazú: 

Arrival at the airport. Our staff will be waiting to assist you in the change of air terminal and 
deliver the travel documentation. Next, boarding the flight that will take you to Puerto Iguazú. 
Reception and private transfer to the Hotel. 

 

Day 3.   
Iguazú: 

Full day private tour to the Iguazú National Park. Visit to the Argentine Falls, impressive 
scenery of one of the Seven Natural Wonders of the World. During the unforgettable tour we 
recommend hiring, optionally, "The Great Adventure", which starts with a boat ride in zodiac 
boats and is extended by double-traction convertible vehicles to discover the rainforest. 
Accommodation. 

 

Day 4.   
Iguazú: 

Private excursion to Do Iguazú National Park, where you will contemplate a magnificent 
panoramic view of the falls from the Brazilian side. In the afternoon, optionally, you can go 
into the jungle and live an Eco-tourism and adventure experience taking the "Iguazú Forest" 
tour (Canopy, rappel in the waterfall and hike in the jungle). Accommodation. 

 

Day 5.   
Iguazú – Posadas: 

Private transfer to visit the Semi Precious Stones of Wanda. In the tour you will see plantation 
of Tea, Yerba Mate and other products. You will also visit The Guarani Jesuit Missions of the 
XVII Century of San Ignacio Mini, Santa Ana and La Candelaria. Lodging in the City of Posadas 
in the Hotel Gran Hotel Posadas. Accommodation. 



 

 

 

Day 6.   
Posadas – Iberá Wetlands: 

Transfer in 4x4 vehicles to the Iberá Natural Reserve, located in the province of Corrientes, 
which is one of the most important freshwater reserves in South America. It has an area of 
1,300,000 hectares in which the native flora and fauna of the region are preserved. Here it is 
possible to find 85 species of mammals, 35 of reptiles and 45 of amphibians. The most 
outstanding are the deer of the swamps, the deer of the pampas, the capybaras and the black 
howler monkey. There are also reptiles such as the black yacaré and the yacaré overo, and 
several kinds of snakes and lizards. Some of the hardest specimens to observe are the maned 
wolf and the river wolf. Accommodation at the Estancia El Socorro with full board (breakfast, 
lunch, dinner and non-alcoholic drinks at meals). 

 

Day 7.   
Iberá Wetlands: 

At Estancia El Socorro you will live an unforgettable experience visiting species recovered 
from extinction, such as the Giant Anteater, tapirs and peccaries and their biggest challenge: 
the reproduction of the Jaguareté. Wildlife wanders through the park of the ranch and you 
may cross with a capybara, a family of rheas or foxes. At night, in lake zafaris that are made in 
the light of the moon, you will see the black tatú and the wild cat. Accommodation with full 
board. 

 

Day 8.   
Iberá Wetlands – Estancia El Socorro: 

Sailing through the Iberá lagoon, to spot the yacarés, the deer of the marshes, and a 
spectacular variety of birds. Accommodation with full board. 

 

Day 9.   
Iberá Wetlands – Mercedes – Buenos Aires: 

Private transfer to the Mercedes Bus Terminal. Private transfer to Buenos Aires. 

 

Day 10.   
Buenos Aires: 

Reception and private transfer to the Hotel. 

 

 

 



 

 

 

Day 11.   
Buenos Aires: 

Private City Tour through Buenos Aires that will invite you to discover the secrets, the 
architecture and the beautiful parks of this metropolis that combines the classic with the 
modern. The most representative neighborhoods that will be visited are: La Boca, San 
Telmo, Puerto Madero, Recoleta and Palermo. At night, a "Tango Show" Dinner will be the 
best way to experience the tango in all its splendor. 

 

Day 12.   
Buenos Aires: 

Day off. It is suggested to make a half-day excursion to the Delta del Tigre, returning to the 
City of Buenos Aires by navigating the Río de la Plata. 

 

Day 13.   
Buenos Aires - Europe: 

Private transfer to the airport to board the International flight that will take you back to your 
country. End of our services. 

 

 

 

Socorro’s Corner 

Includes: 

.10 nights of luxury accommodation with breakfast  

.Private Service Excursions  

.Private Service Transfers  

.Services detailed on the itinerary   

 

Does Not Include: 

.Park National Entrance 

.Travel Secure and Trip Cancellation Coverage 

.Extra Services not detailed on the itinerary 

.Air Tickets  

 


